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Dear Mr. Robert F. Kennedy Jr.,  
Secretary of the U.S. Department of Health and Human Services, 
 
 
In response to your letter of support dated October 9., 2024,  I am writing to inform you of the 
following material facts.  
 
I am the Plenipotentiary of the Government of the Slovak Republic for the Review of Management 
Processes and Resource Allocation During the COVID-19 Pandemic and I am a member of the 
Government of the Slovak Republic and a Member of the National Council.  
 
I was the sole representative of the only country that rejected the IHR regulations and opposed 
the WHO's efforts to centralize power.  
 
The pathological mechanisms of action of the S-protein have been accurately described by 
Richard M. Fleming, PhD, MD, JD , for which I owe him a huge debt of gratitude. While Dr. Fleming 
has demonstrated the adverse effects of adding the COVID vaccines directly to human blood and 
has addressed the importance of vaccine contaminants and civil liability under U.S. Strict Product 
Liability, the assumption of DNA contamination has not been unequivocally confirmed by any 
government.  
 
Therefore, as a member of the Slovakian Government, I would like to inform you that extremely 
high levels of DNA have been confirmed in the vaccines used for the Slovak population, which 
cannot be regarded as 'contamination'.  
 
None of the manufacturers have declared DNA content as a normal component of vaccines. The 
high amounts of DNA present in the samples tested exclude the possibility of simple contamination 
during the manufacturing process.  
 
High DNA contamination of vaccines poses an extremely high potential risk of incorporation of 
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genetic information into human DNA and the possible development of cancer by influencing the 
activity of 9-pathways outlined by Dr. Fleming including tumour-suppressor genes.  
 
The material provided by Richard M. Fleming, PhD, MD, JD,  his recent material submitted to U.S. 
Attorney General Pamela Jo Bondi and the result of the analysis I am providing you now calls for 
the immediate investigation, indictment and prosecution of those responsible for the financing, 
development and release of SARS-CoV-2 viruses as well as investigation of the genetic vaccines that 
contained the genetic code sequences of the biological viral agent and an extremely high level of 
DNA information.  
 
I ask you, as a strong partner of a strong state, to immediately call for the cessation of use of these 
genetic vaccines examine the content of the vaccines used for the population in your country and 
also to examine all the expert findings, materials and evidence provided by Richard M. Fleming, 
PhD, MD, JD. If my concerns are confirmed,findings which Dr. Fleming has reviewed and confirms 
as scientifically valid given the evidence we have provided him, I ask that you publish your own and 
Slovakia's results and support Slovakia's positions and conclusions.  
 
At the same time, it is time to lay the foundations of an international structure that will ensure 
cooperation and protection of public health at global level and replace the WHO, which failed to 
coordinate and cooperate between individual countries during the COVID-19 pandemic.  
 
I therefore request and ask for a meeting between Dr. Fleming, you and me, to discuss possible 
cooperation in the event of another pandemic, and at the same time to lay the foundations for the 
creation of a new alliance for the protection of global health.  
 
Respectfully, 
 
Peter Kotlar 
 
Bratislava, 12.3.2025,  Slovak republic 
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